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Hello, Classmates. I'll be coordinating the compilation of our "memory book." The book, for 
those who've never seen one before, is a collection of individual biographies and photos of, 
and articles about, Crawfordsville and everything Wabash. 
  
I need your help with this project - I need your bios, up to one page per person. The College has 
set up a website which makes it easy to enter your information. Clicking on this hyperlink: 
http://www.wabash.edu/50reunionform/ will take you to the site & let you enter your 
information. You can write as much or as little as you'd like in each category. Try it; you'll see 
what I'm saying. Unused categories will simply be deleted by the "system" (actually by the 
College's Kim Johnson). 
  
At the bottom of the form you'll have a chance to include up to 3 photos, including one with 
your spouse, if possible. When you click on a "browse" (there is a "browse" button for each of 
the pictures you could attach), you will be taken to your own directory of files, among which 
you might well have some photos you'd like to share. Recent photos would be best, but, 
actually, anything will work. 
  
I've scanned & attached four bios from last year's memory book, so you can see the range of 
possibilities. 
  
If you elect to submit your biography manually, the form on the last page will give us the same 
information.  Please be sure to include photos (electronically in JPG format) or in hard copy (for 
scanning.) 
 
This is your chance to say something nice about yourself, to explain yourself, to share an 
insight, or simply to let your classmates know what you've been up to. In a sense, you can write 
your own "obituary." And you WILL have to write your own; the only way to escape here is to 
pass away - then your living unit reps and / or someone from the College will do what they can 
to represent you. 
  
We hope to hear from you by the first week in January 2014. Many thanks for joining in this 
effort. 
  
Thanks! 
 
Ron Nichols  
Wabash Class of 1964 
Memory Book Coordinator 
 

http://www.wabash.edu/50reunionform/


 
 

 



 

 



 
 
 



 



Class of 1964 Biography Form for Memory Book 
 
Name: 
 
Address: 
Address2: 
City/Town: 
State/Province: 
ZIP/Postal Code: 
Country: 
 
Home Phone: 
Cell Phone: 
Email Address: 
 
Family Information: 
 
 
Work Experiences: 
 
 
Volunteer/Vocational Activities I Have Enjoyed: 
 
 
Memorable Travels - Related to Work or Pleasure: 
 
 
Influence of Wabash on My Life; and/or Special Memories of  
 
Campus Life, Faculty & Staff: 
 
 
Ways in Which I've Changed Since my College Days: 
 
 
What I Especially Want to See and/or Do During the Reunion Weekend: 
 
 
I'm Likely to Attend the 50th Reunion Weekend:  Yes      No  
 
 
Please send recent photos of yourself (in JPG format or hard copy) 
 
 


